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Dr. Jamie Howard of the Child Mind Institute 
answers questions from parents and teachers  

about how to talk to children about school 
lockdown drills.te 

 

     Practicing lockdown drills is in the spirit of 
something we call coping ahead, being prepared, 
and I agree that it can be a positive experience. 
When you're dealing with something potentially 
frightening, if you can get ahead of the anxiety, 
then kids feel more in control. They feel a sense 
of competence. They know that the teachers have 
a plan, and the whole thing can make them feel 
quite safe. 
     You want to be really honest with kids about 
the low probability that a stranger would come 
into our school who doesn't belong here, who 
would want to hurt us. But we want to make sure 
we have a solid plan.  
     The manner or style in which you 
communicate this is important. You want to do it 
in an easy matter, and talk about it with a lot of 
confidence and competence. Because kids read 
the tone of voice, the emotion in the presentation. 
     You want to communicate that we're in 
charge, this is our school, and we want to make 
sure that only people who belong here are here. 
Just like if there a snow day we have a plan, if 
there's a storm we have a plan, if someone who 
doesn't' belong here is in the building, we have a 
plan to handle it. 
    Then you want to practice from time to time. 
And you can even make it a community-building 
exercise. We want our whole school to stay safe. 
We're all taking part in this. We're strong and 
competent. We can handle this. 
 

 

     Avoiding the topic is not a good idea, 
because avoidance maintains anxiety. For any 
kids who do have anxiety about a school 
shooting, not talking about it is only colluding in 
the avoidance that maintains that anxiety. So 
you want to talk about it. 
     Also, this kind of drill might even present an 
opportunity to identify kids who might be more 
anxious than people know. You can talk to them 
in more detail. Ask open-ended questions about 
what they're scared about. You want to 
emphasize the low probability, concrete safety 
measures that are being taken, that sort of 
thing. 
     In terms of how explicit you should be, use 
common sense. Don't talk in code or use 
euphemisms with kids—that can make their 
imaginations go wild. But you also don't want to 
plant gruesome images in their heads. You want 
to strike the right balance. 
     You might want to say that if someone 
wanted to hurt our school, students or teachers, 
a member of our school community, we don't 
want that. We wouldn't stand for that. So we 
have a plan to prevent that from happening. A 
lot of the message is in the delivery: We're 
being extra careful here, but with this plan we 
are confident that we are going to stay safe. 
 
Jamie Howard, PhD 

Director of the Stress and Resilience Program 

Clinical Psychologist, Anxiety and Mood Disorders Center 

Child Mind Institute 

childmind.org 

 

Updated: September 15, 2013 

Reprinted with the permission of the Child Mind Institute. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Counselor’s 

Corner 
February 2016 

For further details or information, please contact your child’s guidance counselor: 
 

   Mrs. Kelly B. Maire  Mrs. Patricia Morris            Dr. Kelly Stankiewicz       Mrs. Diane Langworthy 

   Angelo L. Tomasso School Central School   Mount Horeb School       Woodland School 
  (908) 753-5300 x 5305  (908) 753-5300 x 5205  (908) 753-5300 x 5405       (908) 753-5300 x 5505 
   kblessing-maire@warrentboe.org  pmorris@warrentboe.org   kellystankiewicz@warrentboe.org        dlangworthy@warrentboe.org 
 
   Mrs. Midge Johnson  Ms. Lauren Regal  Ms. Helen Scully 

   Middle School- 6
th

 grade  Middle School – 7
th

 grade      Middle School - 8
th

 grade  
   (908) 753-5300 x 5005  (908) 753-5300 x 5009  (908) 753-5300 x 5007       
   mjohnson@warrentboe.org lregal@warrentboe.org    hscully@warrentboe.org  
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